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BARBARA  H. ALLEN

Pittsburgh,  PA  15217

BILL  FOR LAW  CLERK  SERVICES

QUICKEN  LOANS  INC. V. WALTERS,  No, 16-0298

Date

5/17 /17

Activity

Phone call with Justice
Walker

HOurS

.25

Charge

N/(,

5/19/17  Phone call with Edye Nash; ,25
Arrange  to getAppendix

Record

N/C

5/21/17

S/22/17

5/23/17

Read  briefs

Begin  reading  and  analyzing

Appendix  Record

Continue  reading  and

analyztng  Record

3 50

2.50

$400,00

$700,00

$500.oo

5 /23  /17  Phone call with Justice
Walker

,30 N/C

5/25/17

5/26/17

5/28/17

5/30/17

5/31/17

6/01/17

Begtn  research

Continue  research

Begin  draftmg opinton

Continue  drafting  and

additionaJ  research

Continue  drafting

Continue  drafting  and

additional  research

4.00  $800.00

3.00  $600,oo

3,50  $700,oo

7.00  $1,400,oo

5 50 $1,100.00

$1,200.00

6/02/17  Continue drafting 4,50 $900.00



6/03/17

6/04/17

6/05/17

6/05/17

6/05117

6/06/17

6/07  /17

6/09/17

Continue  drafting

Continue  drafting

Travel  to Charleston

Phone call with Justice
Walker

Continue  drafting;  making

changes as per di:9cussionS

with  Justice Walker

Finalizing  draft  opinion;

Meeting  with  Justi(B

Walker;  cite checking  in

Law Library

Final edits  to Opinion;

Travel  back to Pittsburgp

TOT At, HOURS:

TOT AL CHARGES BEFORE CAP:

AGREED-UPON  CAP:

2 00

4 00

.25

4,5o

10,50

4 00

74.75

$400.00

$700,00

N/C

N/C

$900.00

$2,100,00

$700.00

N/C

$14,950.00

nCOh=NFy TO 46iNS

SIGNED %/t e 2J/7



Troy,  Sue

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:

johnson,  Gary

Thursday,  June  22, 2017 11:46  AM

Humphrey,  Whitney

Troy, Sue

RE: Barbara  Alien

Please send the  invoice  down  and  we wili  take  care  of  it.

From:  Humphrey,  Whitney

Sent:  Thursday,  June  22, 2017  11:42  AM

To: jahnson,  Gary  <Gary.Johnson@courtswv.gov>

CC: PaiettaDaViS/  LOri <LOriOPaiettaDaViS@COurtSWV.j;40V>

SubJect: Barbara  Allen

Judge  Johnson  and Lori,

Barbara  Allen  recently  wrote  an opinion  for  Justice  Walker,  and today  we received  an invoice  from  her.  Justice  Waiker

understands  Ms.  Allen  did  work  for  the  Court  last  year,  but  wasn't  sure  if she was stil!  an approved  vendor  or if a formal

contract  is necessary?

i also  messaged  Sue Troy,  but  she is out  of  the  office  today  and i won't  be back  in untit  next  week.  We'd  like to get  Ms,

Ailen's  invoice  approyed  as soon  as possible  so she can receive  payment.

Thanks!

Whitney  Humphrey
Administrative  Assistant
Office of Justice  Elizabeth  D Waiker
West Virginia State Supreme  Court of Appeals
Bldg 1. Room E302
1900 Kanawha Blvd E.
Charleston,  WV 25305
304-340-2317
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